
















































































City of Tonganoxie www.tonganoxie.org (913) 845-2620 
  

 
Office of the City Manager 

AGENDA STATEMENT 
DATE:  November 5, 2018 

TO:  Brandon Harder, City Building Official 

SUBJECT:  Ordinance 1451-Ordinance 1457: Adoption of 2012 International Building Codes, 2011 National 
Electric Code, and 2012 International Fire Code 

 
DISCUSSION: 
City staff request that the City Council consider adoption of the 2012 edition of the International Building 
Codes, which includes Residential, Mechanical, Plumbing, and Fuel Gas, as well as the 2011 edition of the 
National Electric Code and 2012 edition of the International Fire Code.  
 
In 2001, the City of Tonganoxie adopted the 2000 Plumbing, Building, and Residential Codes and the 1997 
Mechanical and Uniform Housing Codes. In 2008, the City of Tonganoxie adopted the 2003 edition of the 
International Fire Code. In 2012, the City of Tonganoxie adopted the 2003 edition of the International Fuel Gas 
Code, Mechanical Code, Plumbing Code, Building Code, and Residential Code along with the 2002 edition of 
the National Electric Code.  
 
Part of this update is bringing the valuation table used to assess building permits up to the version used in the 
2012 edition of the International Building Code. The City has operated using the valuation table associated with 
the 2000 edition of the International Building Code since 2001. In 2012, the City did not update to the 2003 
edition valuation table when the update to the newer edition of the codes were completed.  
 
The draft ordinances prepared for the transition to the more current codes are designed to take effect January 
1, 2019, which will permit the City to complete efforts to communicate the change to the public and builders 
within the community, as well as to update all City forms to reflect the changes.  In addition, City staff plan to 
propose an ordinance to consolidate and update miscellaneous and specialized building permit fees before 
2019. Currently these fees exist in multiple portions of the City Code and are difficult for the public to locate 
and fully understand.  
 
BUDGET IMPACT: 
None. 
 
ACTION NEEDED: 
Make a motion to adopt the seven ordinances and one resolution associated with updating  the building and 
fire codes, along with setting specialized and miscellaneous permit fees.  
 
ATTACHMENTS: 
Ordinance 1451 
Ordinance 1452 
Ordinance 1453 
Ordinance 1454 
Ordinance 1455 
Ordinance 1456 
Ordinance 1457 
 
cc:  George Brajkovic, City Manager 

Shannon Marcano, City Attorney 
John Zimbelman, Fire Chief  
Dan Porter, Assistant City Manager 



1 

 

 

 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 1451 

 

 

 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 4-202 OF THE TONGANOXIE CITY CODE TO 

PROVIDE FOR THE ADOPTION BY REFERENCE OF THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL 

BUILDING CODE 

 

WHEREAS, the City of Tonganoxie desires to update its building standards by adopting by 

reference the 2012 edition of the International Building Code. 

 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF 

TONGANOXIE, KANSAS: 

 

SECTION 1.     That the 2012 edition of the International Building Code is hereby adopted by 

reference, and that Section 4-202 of the Tonganoxie City Code be revised to read as follows, 

with the removal of the stricken language, and the addition of the language in italics:   
 

4-202. INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE INCORPORATED. 
A certain document, three copies of which are on file in the office of the city clerk of the city of 
Tonganoxie, being marked and designated as the International Building Code, 2003 Edition 2012 
Edition, including Appendix Chapters C, E and I (see International Building Code Section 101.2.1, 
2003 Edition 2012 Edition), as published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby 
adopted as the Building Code of the city of Tonganoxie, in the State of Kansas, for regulating and 
governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing 
the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions essential 
to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation 
of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such 
structures as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; 
and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Building 
Code on file in the office of the city of Tonganoxie are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a 
part hereof, as if fully set out in this article, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if 
any, prescribed in this section. 

The following sections are hereby revised: 101.1, 101.4.1, 101.4.7 101.4.6 is deleted, 105.1.1 is 
deleted, 105.1.2 is deleted, 105.2, 108.3 108.3 revised, 109.3.7 is deleted and Chapter 9, Section 
903 is amended, Chapter 13 is deleted, 1612.13, 3109.4 is amended to reference Appendix G of 
the 2003 International Residential Code, 3303.4 and 3410.2 are amended. (Ord. 1334Ord _____)  
 
in more detail as follows: 
 
101.4.1 Deleted (Electrical) – The provisions of the 2002 National Electrical Code shall apply (not 
listed in 2012 IBC) 
101.4.7 Updated to 101.4.6 Deleted – International Energy Conservation Code. 
108.3 revised – The applicant for a (remodeling or addition < remove) permit shall provide an 
estimated permit value at time of application. Permit valuations shall include total value of work 
including materials and labor for which the permit is being issued, such as electrical, gas, 
mechanical, plumbing equipment, and permanent systems. If, in the opinion of the code official, 
the valuation is underestimated on the application, the permit shall be denied unless the applicant 
can show detailed estimates to meet the approval of the code official.  Final building permit 
valuation shall be set by the code official. 
109.3.7 – Energy efficiency inspection (not titled in IBC 2012) 
 

 

https://www.codepublishing.com/KS/Tonganoxie/#!/Tonganoxie09/Tonganoxie09.html#IX
https://www.codepublishing.com/KS/Tonganoxie/#!/Tonganoxie13/Tonganoxie13.html#XIII


2 

 

 

 

 

 

SECTION 2.  That Section 4-213 of the Tonganoxie City Code be revised to read as follows, 

with the removal of the stricken language, and the addition of the language in italics:   

 

(a)    The fee for a building permit shall be calculated using the valuation of the improvement 

excluding land. The fees shall be calculated in accordance with the following schedule. 

Valuation Permit Fee 

$1 - $500 $30 $24 

$501 - $2,000 $30 + $5 for @ $100 value over $500$24 for the first $500; 

plus $3 for each additional $100 or fraction thereof, up to and 

including $2,000 

$2,001 - $25,000 

$40,000 

$105 + $10 for @ $1,000 value over $2,000 $69 for the first 

$2,000; plus $11 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, up 

to and including $40,000 

$25,001 - $50,000 

$40,001 to $100,000 

$335 + $9 for @ $1,000 value over $25,000 $487 for the first 

$40,000; plus $9 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, up 

to and including $100,000 

$50,001 - $100,000 

$100,001 to $500,000 

$560 + $8 for @ $1,000 value over $50,000 $1,027 for the first 

$100,000; plus $7 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, up 

to and including $500,000 

$100,001 - $500,000 

$500,001 to 

$1,000,000 

$960 + $7 for @ $1,000 value over $100,000 $3,827 for the 

first $500,000; plus $5 for each additional $1,000 or fraction 

thereof, up to and including $1,000,000 

$500,001 and Up 

$1,000,001 to 

$5,000,000 

$3,760 + $6.50 over @ $1,000 value over $500,000 $6,327 

for the first $1,000,000; plus $3 for each additional $1,000 or 

fraction thereof, up to and including $5,000,000 

$5,000,001 and over $18,327 for the first $5,000,000; plus $1 for each additional $1,000 

or fraction thereof 

(b)    All driveway approach or driveway construction w ill be charged a permit fee of $25. 

(c)    Fence installation will require a permit. The permit fee will be $25. 



3 

 

The fee herein shall be paid to the city clerk upon obtaining a building permit and the same shall 

be credited to the general operating fund of the city. 

SECTION 3.     That this ordinance shall take effect and be enforced from and after its passage, 

approval, and publication in the Tonganoxie Mirror, the official newspaper of the City of 

Tonganoxie. 

 

SECTION 4.         That all ordinances that conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are 

hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict.   

 

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL THIS 5
th

 DAY OF NOVEMBER, 2018.  

 

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR THIS 5
TH

 DAY OF NOVEMBER, 2018. 

       

 

 

(Seal)             

       ___________________________________ 

Jason K. Ward, Mayor 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Attest: 

 

 

___________________________________                                

Patricia C. Hagg, City Clerk 

 

 

Approved as to form: 

 

 

_________________________________ 

Shannon M. Marcano, City Attorney 

 



1 

 

 

 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 1453 

 

 

 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 4-402 OF THE TONGANOXIE CITY CODE TO 

PROVIDE FOR THE ADOPTION BY REFERENCE OF THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL 

PLUMBING CODE 

 

WHEREAS, the City of Tonganoxie desires to update its plumbing standards by adopting by 

reference the 2012 edition of the International Plumbing Code. 

 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF 

TONGANOXIE, KANSAS: 

 

SECTION 1.     That the 2012 edition of the International Plumbing Code is hereby adopted by 

reference, and that Section 4-402 of the Tonganoxie City Code be revised to read as follows, 

with the removal of the stricken language, and the addition of the language in italics:   
 

4-402. ADOPTION. 
A certain document, three copies of which are on file in the office of the city clerk of the city of 
Tonganoxie, being marked and designated as the International Plumbing Code, 2003 Edition 
2012 Edition, including Appendix Chapters B, C, D, E and F, as published by the International 
Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Plumbing Code of the city of Tonganoxie, in the 
State of Kansas, regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, 
installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of 
plumbing systems as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees 
therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said 
Plumbing Code on file in the office of the city of Tonganoxie are hereby referred to, adopted, and 
made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this article, with the additions, insertions, deletions and 
changes, if any, prescribed in this section. 

The following sections are hereby revised: 101.1, 106.6.2, 106.6.3, 108.4, 108.5, 305.6.1 305.4.1, 
312.9 312.10, 410.1, 604.9, 904.1 903.1 and 1113.1.1 1114.1.1. (Ord. 1336 _____) 

in more detail as follows: 

305.6.1 Updated to 305.4.1 – Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems 
shall be a minimum of 36 inches below finished grade at the point of septic tank connection.  
Building sewers shall be a minimum of 36 inches below grade. 

312.9 Updated to 312.10 – Inspection and testing shall comply with the regulations and standards 
set forth by City of Tonganoxie Public Works and Water Department. 

904.1 Updated to 903.1 – All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be terminated at 
least 6 inches above the roof, except that where a roof is to be used for any purpose other than 
weather protection, the vent extension shall be run at least 7 feet above the roof. 

1113.1.1 Updated to 1114.1.1 – The sump pump shall be of a capacity and head appropriate to 
anticipated use requirements. Sumps receiving storm water from any exposed exterior drains or 
openings shall be provided with back-up system(s) capable of assuring proper sump operation in 
case of power failure. 

 



2 

 

 

 

 

 

SECTION 2.  That Section 4-412 of the Tonganoxie City Code be revised to read as follows, 

with the removal of the stricken language, and the addition of the language in italics:   

 

The fee herein shall be paid to the city clerk upon obtaining a plumbing permit and the same shall 

be credited to the general operating fund of the city. 

Valuation Permit Fee 

$1 - $500 $30 $24 

$501 - $2,000 $30 + $5 for @ $100 value over $500$24 for the first $500; 

plus $3 for each additional $100 or fraction thereof, up to and 

including $2,000 

$2,001 - $25,000 

$40,000 

$105 + $10 for @ $1,000 value over $2,000 $69 for the first 

$2,000; plus $11 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, up 

to and including $40,000 

$25,001 - $50,000 

$40,001 to $100,000 

$335 + $9 for @ $1,000 value over $25,000 $487 for the first 

$40,000; plus $9 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, up 

to and including $100,000 

$50,001 - $100,000 

$100,001 to $500,000 

$560 + $8 for @ $1,000 value over $50,000 $1,027 for the first 

$100,000; plus $7 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, up 

to and including $500,000 

$100,001 - $500,000 

$500,001 to 

$1,000,000 

$960 + $7 for @ $1,000 value over $100,000 $3,827 for the 

first $500,000; plus $5 for each additional $1,000 or fraction 

thereof, up to and including $1,000,000 

$500,001 and Up 

$1,000,001 to 

$5,000,000 

$3,760 + $6.50 over @ $1,000 value over $500,000 $6,327 

for the first $1,000,000; plus $3 for each additional $1,000 or 

fraction thereof, up to and including $5,000,000 

$5,000,001 and over $18,327 for the first $5,000,000; plus $1 for each additional $1,000 

or fraction thereof 

 

 

 

 

 



3 

 

SECTION 3.     That this ordinance shall take effect and be be enforced on January 1, 2019, after 

its passage, approval, and publication in the Tonganoxie Mirror, the official newspaper of the 

City of Tonganoxie. 

 

SECTION 4.         That all ordinances that conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are 

hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict.   

 

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL THIS 5
th

 DAY OF NOVEMBER, 2018.  

 

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR THIS 5
TH

 DAY OF NOVEMBER, 2018. 

       

 

 

(Seal)             

       ___________________________________ 

Jason K. Ward, Mayor 

 

 

 

 

Attest: 

 

 

___________________________________                                

Patricia C. Hagg, City Clerk 

 

 

Approved as to form: 

 

 

_________________________________ 

Shannon M. Marcano, City Attorney 

 



1 

 

 

 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 1456 

 

 

 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 4-302 OF THE TONGANOXIE CITY CODE TO 

PROVIDE FOR THE ADOPTION BY REFERENCE OF THE 2011 NATIONAL 

ELECTRICAL CODE 

 

WHEREAS, the City of Tonganoxie desires to update its electrical standards by adopting by 

reference the 2012 edition of the National Electrical Code. 

 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF 

TONGANOXIE, KANSAS: 

 

SECTION 1.     That the 2011 edition of the National Electrical Code is hereby adopted by 

reference, and that Section 4-302 of the Tonganoxie City Code be revised to read as follows, 

with the removal of the stricken language, and the addition of the language in italics:   
 

4-302. ADOPTION OF ELECTRICAL CODE BY REFERENCE. 
A certain document, three copies of which are on file in the office of the city clerk of the city of 
Tonganoxie, being marked and designated as the National Electrical Code, 2002 Edition 2011 
Edition, as published by the National Fire Protection Association, be and is hereby adopted as the 
Electrical Code of the city of Tonganoxie, in the State of Kansas, regulating and governing the 
design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, 
relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of electrical systems as herein provided; 
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the 
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Electrical Code on file in the office 
of the city of Tonganoxie are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set 
out in this article, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in this 
section. 

The following sections are hereby revised: Article 210-12 is deleted is revised and Article 230-70 
is revised and section 406.12 is deleted. (Ord. 1335_____) 

in more detail as follows: 

210.12 Arc-Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection. 

Dwelling Units. All 120-volt, single phase, 15- and 20-ampere branch circuits supplying outlets 
installed in dwelling unit family rooms, dining rooms, living rooms, parlors, libraries, dens, 
bedrooms, sunrooms, recreation rooms, closets, hallways, or similar rooms or areas shall be 
protected by a listed arc-fault circuit interrupter, combination-type, installed to provide protection 
of the branch circuit. 

Is revised to say: 

210.12 Arc-Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection. 

 

Dwelling Unit Bedrooms. All 120-volt, single phase, 15- and 20-ampere branch circuits 
supplying outlets installed in dwelling unit bedrooms shall be protected by a listed arc-fault circuit 
interrupter, combination type installed to provide protection of the branch circuit. 



2 

 

SECTION 2.  That Section 4-313 of the Tonganoxie City Code be revised to read as 

follows, with the removal of the stricken language, and the addition of the language in 

italics: 

The fee herein shall be paid to the city clerk upon obtaining an electrical permit and the same 

shall be credited to the general operating fund of the city. The fees shall be calculated in 

accordance with the following schedule: 

Valuation Permit Fee 

$1 - $500 $30 $24 

$501 - $2,000 $30 + $5 for @ $100 value over $500$24 for the first $500; 

plus $3 for each additional $100 or fraction thereof, up to and 

including $2,000 

$2,001 - $25,000 

$40,000 

$105 + $10 for @ $1,000 value over $2,000 $69 for the first 

$2,000; plus $11 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, up 

to and including $40,000 

$25,001 - $50,000 

$40,001 to $100,000 

$335 + $9 for @ $1,000 value over $25,000 $487 for the first 

$40,000; plus $9 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, up 

to and including $100,000 

$50,001 - $100,000 

$100,001 to $500,000 

$560 + $8 for @ $1,000 value over $50,000 $1,027 for the first 

$100,000; plus $7 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, up 

to and including $500,000 

$100,001 - $500,000 

$500,001 to 

$1,000,000 

$960 + $7 for @ $1,000 value over $100,000 $3,827 for the 

first $500,000; plus $5 for each additional $1,000 or fraction 

thereof, up to and including $1,000,000 

$500,001 and Up 

$1,000,001 to 

$5,000,000 

$3,760 + $6.50 over @ $1,000 value over $500,000 $6,327 

for the first $1,000,000; plus $3 for each additional $1,000 or 

fraction thereof, up to and including $5,000,000 

$5,000,001 and over $18,327 for the first $5,000,000; plus $1 for each additional $1,000 

or fraction thereof 

 

 

 



3 

 

SECTION 3.     That this ordinance shall take effect and be enforced on January 1, 2019, after its 

passage, approval, and publication in the Tonganoxie Mirror, the official newspaper of the City 

of Tonganoxie. 

 

SECTION 4.         That all ordinances that conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are 

hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict.   

 

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL THIS 5
th

 DAY OF NOVEMBER, 2018.  

 

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR THIS 5
TH

 DAY OF NOVEMBER, 2018. 

       

 

 

(Seal)             

       ___________________________________ 

Jason K. Ward, Mayor 

 

 

Attest: 

 

 

___________________________________                                

Patricia C. Hagg, City Clerk 

 

 

Approved as to form: 

 

 

_________________________________ 

Shannon M. Marcano, City Attorney 



1 

 

 

 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 1457 

 

 

 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 7-201 OF THE TONGANOXIE CITY CODE TO 

PROVIDE FOR THE ADOPTION BY REFERENCE OF THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE 

CODE 

 

WHEREAS, the City of Tonganoxie desires to update its building standards by adopting by 

reference the 2012 edition of the International Fire Code. 

 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF 

TONGANOXIE, KANSAS: 

 

SECTION 1.     That the 2012 edition of the International Fire Code is hereby adopted by 

reference, and that Section 7-201 of the Tonganoxie City Code be revised to read as follows, 

with the removal of the stricken language, and the addition of the language in italics:   
 

7-201. KANSAS BUILDINGS FIRE SAFETY ADOPTED.  
In order to provide the City of Tonganoxie rules and regulations to improve the safety of the 
public by promoting the control of fire hazards, governing conditions hazardous to life and 
property from fire or explosion, those certain standards know as Kansas Buildings Fire Safety 
Handbook, 1999 Second Edition, are hereby adopted and incorporated by reference, save the 
and except for such portions as hereinafter deleted, modified or amended. The Kansas 
Buildings Fire Safety Handbook, Second Edition, is made part of the ordinances of the City of 
Tonganoxie as if the same had been set out in full herein, all as authorized and in the manner 
prescribed by K.S.A. 12-3009 through 12-3012 including any amendments thereto. No fewer 
that three copies of the Kansas Buildings Fire Safety Handbook, 1999 Second Edition shall be 
marked or stamped "Official Copy as Incorporated by the City of Tonganoxie" and shall be filed 
with the city clerk to be opened for inspection and available to the public at all reasonable hours 
of business. (Ord. 1079, Sec. 1; Code 2004) 
a.    International Fire Code Incorporated—omissions—additions. There is hereby incorporated 
by reference the International Fire Code, 200312 Edition, including Appendix Chapters A, B, C, 
D, E, F, and G, prepared and published in book form by the International Code Council, Inc., 
5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, Virginia 22041-3401. (Ord. 1259______) 
b.    International Fire Code 2003 edition Section 109.3 amended. 
Section 109.3 Violation penalties. Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to 
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a 
building or structure in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire 
code official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 
subject to penalties as prescribed by law. Each day that a violation continues after due notice 
has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. 
109.3.1 Abatement of violation. In addition to the imposition of the penalties herein described, 
the fire code official is authorized to institute appropriate action to prevent unlawful construction 
or to restrain, correct or abate a violation; or to prevent illegal occupancy of a structure or 
premises; or to stop an illegal act, conduct of business or occupancy of a structure on or about 
any premise. (Ord. 1259) 
c.    International Fire Code 2003 edition section 907.2.9 amended. Group R-2. A fire alarm 
system shall be installed in Group R-2 occupancies where: 
1.    Any dwelling unit or sleeping unit is located three or more stories above the lowest level of 
exit discharge; 

http://kslegislature.org/li_2012/b2011_12/statute/012_000_0000_chapter/012_030_0000_article/012_030_0009_section/012_030_0009_k/
http://kslegislature.org/li_2012/b2011_12/statute/012_000_0000_chapter/012_030_0000_article/012_030_0012_section/012_030_0012_k/


2 

 

2.    Any dwelling unit or sleeping unit is located more than one story below the highest level of 
exit discharge of exits serving the dwelling unit or sleeping unit; or 
3.    The building contains more than six dwelling units or sleeping units. 
Exceptions: 1. A fire alarm system is not required in buildings equal to or under two stories in 
height where all dwelling units and contiguous attic and crawl spaces are     separated from 
each other and public or common areas by at least 1-hour fire partitions and each dwelling unit 
has an exit directly to a public way, exit court or yard. 2. Manual fire alarm boxes are not 
required throughout the building when the following conditions are met: 
2.1    The building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 
903.3.1.1 or Section 903.3.1.2; 
2.2    The notification appliances will activate upon sprinkler flow; and 
2.3    At least one manual fire alarm box is installed in an approved location. 
3.    A fire alarm system is not required in buildings that do not have internal corridors serving 
dwelling units and are protected by an approved automatic fire sprinkler     system installed in 
accordance with Sections 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 provided that dwelling units either have a 
means of egress door opening directly to an exterior exit     access that leads directly to the 
exits or are served by open ended corridors designed     in accordance with Section 1022.6 
Exception 4. (Ord. 1259) 
d.    Section 15.32.030 International Fire Code 2003 Edition, Chapter 33 amended. 
Section 3301.2 Required. A permit application shall be made to the Fire Prevention Bureau 
who shall issue the same only if the Fire Chief or his designated representative shall after 
inspection approve issuance of the permit. There shall be a fee of one hundred dollars, 
($100.00), for making such application. Permits shall expire thirty (30) days after date of 
issuance. 
Permits shall be obtained: 
1.     To manufacture, possess, store, sell, display, or otherwise dispose of explosive materials 
at any location. 
2.    To use explosive materials. 
3.    To operative a terminal for handling explosive materials. 
Section 3301.2.1 — Residential Uses. No person shall keep or store, nor shall any permit be 
issued to keep or store, any explosives at any place of habitation, or within 100 feet (38,480 
mm) thereof; 
Exception: Storage of smokeless propellant, black powder, and small arms primers for personal 
use and not for resale in accordance with Section 3306. 
Section 3301.4 Qualifications. Persons in charge of magazines, blasting, fireworks display, or 
pyrotechnic special effect operations shall not be under the influence of alcohol or drugs which 
impair sensory motor skills, shall be at least 21 years of age, and shall demonstrate knowledge 
of all safety precautions related to the storage, handling or use of explosives, explosive 
materials or fireworks; and 
possess a valid Blasters Certificate issued by the State of Kansas Fire Marshal Office. 
Section 3307.4 Hours of operation. Blasting operations shall be conducted Monday through 
Friday only between the hours of 8:30 A.M. and 4:30 P.M. 
Exception: When other times are approved by the Fire Chief or his/her designated 
representative. 
Section 3307.16 Pre-blast Survey. At least 15 days before initiation of blasting, the surveyor 
shall notify, in writing, all residents or owners of dwellings or other structures located within 500 
feet of the blasting area of the intent to conduct a pre-blasting survey. The Fire Marshal may 
identify alternate re-blast survey distances. 
The surveyor shall promptly conduct a pre-blasting survey of the dwellings or structures and 
promptly prepare a written report of the survey. An updated survey of any additions, 
modifications, or renovations shall be performed by the surveyor if requested by the contractor 
or Fire Marshal. 
The surveyor shall determine the condition of the dwelling or structure and shall document any 
existing damage and other physical factors that could reasonably be affected by the blasting. 
The surveyor shall examine the interior as well as exterior structure and shall document any 
damage by means of photographic or videocassette methods. Structures such as pipelines, 



3 

 

cables, transmission lines, cisterns, wells and other water systems warrant special attention; 
however, the assessment of these structures may be limited to surface conditions and other 
readily available data. 
The written report of the survey shall be signed by the person who conducted the survey. 
Copies of the report shall be promptly provided to the contractor and made available to the Fire 
Marshal. All surveys shall be completed by the surveyor before the initiation of blasting. All 
surveys shall be conducted by a disinterested third party, regularly engaged in performing pre-
blast surveys. 
The contractor shall notify the owner of all gas, water, and petroleum pipelines in any area 
where blasting will be utilized. A representative of the pipeline shall be allowed to be present to 
observe preparations and blasting. 
Section 3307.17 Ground Vibration. Regardless of the distance to nearby facilities, buildings or 
other structures, the blasting operations shall be carried out in such a manner that they will not 
cause flyrock damage or damage from airblast overpressure or ground vibration. The contractor 
or operator shall conduct seismic monitoring of all blasts. The seismic recording site shall be 
located at the nearest structure or building within 500 feet of the blast site. 
The maximum peak particle velocity at any such recording site shall not exceed one inch per 
second in any one of three mutually perpendicular directions. 
Section 3307.18 Distance from structures. There shall be no blasting within one hundred feet 
of any structure or building. 
Section 3307.19 Blasting Records. The contractor shall retain a record of all blasts for at least 
three (3) years. Upon request copies of these records shall be made available to the Fire 
Marshal and to the public for inspection. Such records shall contain the following data: 
a.    Name of the contractor conducting the blast. 
b.    Location, date and time of the blast. 
c.    Name, signature, and certification number of the blaster conducting the blast. 
d.    Identification, direction, and distance, in feet, from the nearest blast hole to the nearest 
dwelling, public building, school, church, community or institutional building outside the permit 
area, except those described herein. 
e.    Weather conditions, including those which may cause possible adverse blasting effects. 
f.    Type of material blasted. 
g.    Sketches of the blast pattern including number of holes, burden, spacing, decks and delay 
pattern. 
h.    Diameter and depth of holes. 
i.    Types of explosives used. 
j.    Total weight of explosives used per hole. 
k.    The maximum weight of explosives detonated in an 8-millisecond period. 
l.    Initiation system. 
m.    Type and length of stemming. 
n.    Mats or other protections used. 
o.    Seismographic and airblast records, shall include: 
1.    Type of instrument, sensitivity, and calibration signal, or certification of annual calibration; 
2.    Exact location of instrument and the date, time and distance from the blast; 
3.    Name of the person and firm taking the reading; 
4.    Name of the person and firm analyzing the seismographic record; and 
5.    The vibration and/or airblast level recorded. 
15.32.040 Permit—Fee—Public displays—Fireworks. When any person makes application for a 
permit of supervised public display of fireworks pursuant to section 3301.2.4.2 of the 
International Fire Code 2003 Edition, the applicant shall at the time of filing application therefore 
pay to the City Clerk an application fee of fifteen dollars ($15.00). The application fee shall 
refunded upon request by the applicant in the event the application for such permit is withdrawn 
or denied prior to an investigation being made as provided under section of such code; 
however, no refund shall be made for any reason after the Fire Chief has made the required 
investigation. 
15.32.050 International Fire Code 2003 Edition Section 3404.2 amended. The storage of Class I 
and Class II liquids in outside aboveground tanks shall be prohibited within the city limits of the 



4 

 

City of Tonganoxie, Kansas excepting in a designated P.I. (Planned Industrial) district and then 
only upon approval of a site development plan, pursuant to Chapter 17.56 of the Tonganoxie 
Municipal Code, and in compliance with said Chapter insofar as the same may be relevant to 
the proposed stationary aboveground tank. 
15.32.065 International Fire Code 2003 Edition, Article 903 amended. Amend Article 903, 
"Automatic Sprinkler Systems," of the International Fire Code, Section 903 of the International 
Fire Code is hereby deleted. And a new Section 903 is added to read as follows: 
903. AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS 
903.1 General. Automatic sprinkler systems shall comply with this section. 
903.1.1 Alternative protection. Alternative automatic fire extinguishing systems complying with 
Section 904 shall be permitted in lieu of automatic sprinkler protection where recognized by the 
applicable standard and approved by the Fire Marshal. 
903.1.2 Residential systems. Unless specifically allowed by this code or the International 
Building Code, residential sprinkler systems installed in accordance with NFPA 13D or NFPA 
13R shall not be recognized for the purposes of exceptions or reductions permitted by other 
requirements of this code. 
903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures 
shall be provided in the locations described in this section. 
Exception: Spaces or area in telecommunications buildings used exclusively for 
telecommunications equipment, batteries and standby engines, provided those spaces or areas 
are equipped throughput with an automatic fire alarm system and are separated from the 
remainder of the building by a wall with a fire-resistance rating of not less than one hour and a 
floor/ceiling assembly with a fire-resistance rating of not less than two hours. 
903.2.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings or 
portions thereof used as Group A occupancies as provided in this section. The automatic 
sprinkler system shall be provided throughout the floor area where the Group A occupancy is 
located, and in all floors between the Group A occupancy and the level of exit discharge. 
903.2.1.1 Group A-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout any floor area 
containing a Group A-1 occupancy where the following conditions exist: 
1.    The area exceeds 4,000 square feet (372 m2). 
2.    The area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 
3.    The Group A-1 occupancy is located on a floor other than the level of exit discharge. 
4.    The building contains a multi-theater complex. 
903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout any area 
containing a Group A-2 occupancy where one of the following conditions exist: 
1.    The area exceeds 4,000 square feet (372 m2). 
2.    The area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 
3.    The fire area is located on a floor other than the level of exit discharge. 
903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided throughout any area 
containing a Group A-3 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 
1.    The area exceed 4,000 square feet (372 m2). 
2.    The area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 
3.    The fire area is located on a floor other than the level of exit discharge. 
903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout any area 
containing a Group A-4 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 
1.    The area exceeds 4,000 square feet (372 m2). 
2.    The area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 
3.    The fire area is located on a floor other than the level of exit discharge. 
903.2.1.5 Group A-5. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in concession stands, 
retail areas, press boxes, and other accessory uses areas in excess of 1,000 square feet (93 
m2). 
903.2.2 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group B 
buildings greater than 20,000 square feet (1,858 m2) or the building is more than one story in 
height. 



5 

 

903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group E 
buildings greater than 4,000 square feet (372m2) in area. An automatic sprinkler system shall 
also be provided for every portion of educational buildings below the level of exit discharge. 
903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group F-1 
occupancies exceeding 12,000 square feet (1115 m2), or where more than one story in height. 
903.2.4.1 Woodworking operations. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided 
throughout all Group F-1 occupancies that contain woodworking operations in excess of 2,500 
square feet in area (232 m2) which generate finely divided combustible waste or which use finely 
divided combustible materials. 
903.2.5 Group H. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be provided in high-hazard occupancies as 
required in Sections 903.2.5.1 through 903.2.5.3. 
903.2.5.1 General. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in Group H occupancies. 
903.2.5.2 Group H-5 occupancies. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout 
all Group H-5 occupancies. The design of the sprinkler system shall not be less than that 
required under the International Building Code for the occupancy hazard classifications in 
accordance with Table 903.2.5.2. 
Where the design area of the sprinkler system consists of a corridor protected by one row of 
sprinklers, the maximum number of sprinklers required to calculated is 13. 

Table 903.2.5.2  
Group H-5 Sprinkler Design Criteria 

Location Occupancy Hazard Classification 

Fabrication areas Ordinary Hazard Group 2 

Service corridors Ordinary Hazard Group 2 

Storage rooms without dispensing Ordinary Hazard Group 2 

Storage rooms with dispensing Extra Hazard Group 2 

Corridors Ordinary Hazard Group 

2903.2.5.3 Pyroxylin plastics. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in buildings, or 
portions thereof, where cellulose nitrate film or pyroxylin plastics are manufactured, stored or 
handled in quantities exceeding 100 pounds (45 kg). 
903.2.6 Group I. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group I 
occupancies. 
Exception: An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 or 
903.3.1.3 shall be allowed in Group I-1 facilities. 
903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group M 
occupancies exceeding 12,000 square feet (1115 m2), or where more than one story in height. 
903.2.7.1 High-piled storage. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided as required in 
Chapter 23 in all buildings of Group M where storage of merchandise is in high-piled or rack 
storage arrays. 
903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3 
shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area. 
903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all areas 
containing any Group S-1 occupancy exceeding 12,000 square feet (1115 m2), or where more 
than one story in height. 
903.2.9.1 Repair garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings used as repair garages in accordance with the International Building Code, as follows: 
1.    One-story buildings with a fire area containing a repair garage exceeding 12,000 square 
feet (1115 m2). 
2.    Buildings with a repair garage in the basement. 



6 

 

903.2.9.2 Bulk storage of tires. Buildings and structures where the area for the storage of tire 
exceeds 20,000 cubic feet (566 m2) shall be equipped throughout with an automatic fire 
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1. 
903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings 
classified as an enclosed parking garage in accordance with the International Building Code or 
where located beneath other groups. 
Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies. 
903.2.10.1 Commercial parking garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided 
throughout building used for storage of commercial trucks or buses where the fire area 
exceeds 4.000 square feet (372 m2). 
903.2.11 All occupancies except Groups R-3 and U. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
installed in the locations set forth in Sections 903.2.11.1 through 903.2.11.1.3. 
Exception: Group R-3 and Group U. 
903.2.11.1 Stories and basements without openings. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
installed throughout every story or basement of all buildings where the floor area exceeds 1,500 
square feet (139.4 m2) and where there is not provided at least one of the following types of 
exterior wall openings. 
1.    Openings below grade that lead directly to ground level by an exterior stairway complying 
with Section 1003.3.3 or an outside ramp complying with Section 1003.3.4. Openings shall be 
located in each 50 linear feet (15,240 mm), or fraction thereof, of exterior wall in the story on at 
least one side. 
2.     Openings entirely above the adjoining ground level totaling at least 20 square feet (1.86 
m2) in each 50 linear feet (15,240 mm), or fraction thereof, of exterior wall in the story on at least 
one side. 
903.2.11.1.1 Opening dimensions and access. Openings shall have a minimum dimension of 
not less than 30 inches (762 mm). Such openings shall be accessible to the Fire Department 
from the exterior and shall not be obstructed in a manner that fire fighting or rescue cannot be 
accomplished from the exterior. 
903.2.11.1.2 Openings on one side only. Where openings in a story are provided on only one 
side and the opposite wall of such story is more than 75 feet (22,860 mm) from such openings, 
the story shall be equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system, or 
openings as specified above shall be provided on at least two sides of the story. 
903.2.11.1.3 Basements. Where any portion of a basement is located more than 75 feet 
(22,860 mm) from openings required by Section 903.2.12.1, the basement shall be equipped 
throughout with an approved sprinkler system. 
903.2.11.2 Rubbish and linen chutes. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed at the 
top of rubbish and linen chutes and in their terminal rooms. Chutes extending through three or 
more floors shall have additional sprinkler heads installed within such chutes at alternate floors. 
Chute sprinklers shall be accessible for servicing. 
903.2.11.3 Buildings over 55 feet in height. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed 
throughout buildings with a floor level having an occupant load of 30 or more that is located 55 
feet (16,764 mm) or more above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access. 
903.2.12 Conflict between codes section. 
903.2.12.1 If, at any time, there is a conflict between Section 15.32.065 and any other codes 
adopted by the City of Tonganoxie, the most stringent shall apply. 
903.2.12.2 The provision of fire walls, party walls, property lines, public ways and yards shall not 
affect either the calculation of the total building area, the calculation of dwelling units, or for 
creating separate buildings as allowed by Section 503.1 of the International Building Code for 
the purpose of eliminating the automatic sprinkler system requirements in Section 903.2.1 
through 903.2.14 of this Section, and in no case shall the area of a building, including 
mezzanines exceed 20,000 square feet (1858 m2) unless an automatic fire sprinkler system is 
provided throughout. 
903.2.12.3 Mezzanines shall be included in determining the total floor areas where sprinklers 
are required, but shall not be considered a second story if they meet the Building Code 
requirements for a mezzanine. 



7 

 

903.2.12.4 Outside strobes are required in addition to the water flow alarms (bells, horns) on 
each fire sprinkler system. 
903.2.12.5 When storage occupancies are required to be sprinklered and there is no specific 
occupant, they shall be provided with automatic sprinklers that are designed to the maximum 
possible storage height on racks for a Class III commodity as determined by the National Fire 
Protection Association Pamphlet NFPA 13. 
903.2.13 During construction. Automatic sprinkler systems required during construction, 
alteration and demolition operations shall be provided in accordance with Section 1413. 
903.2.14 Other hazards. Automatic sprinkler protection shall be provided for the hazards 
indicated in 903.2.14.1 and 903.2.14.2. 
903.2.14.1 Ducts conveying hazardous exhaust. Where required by the International 
Mechanical Code, automatic sprinklers shall be provided in ducts conveying hazardous exhaust, 
flammable or combustible materials 
Exception: Ducts where the largest cross-section diameter of the duct is less than 10 inches 
(254 mm). 
903.2.14.2 Commercial cooking operations. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed 
in commercial kitchen exhaust hood and duct system where an automatic sprinkler system is 
used to comply with Section 904. 
903.2.15 Other required suppression systems. In addition to the requirements of Section 
903.2, the provision indicated in Table 903.2.15 also require the installation of a suppression 
system for certain building and areas. 

Table 903.2.15  
Additional Required Fire- Extinguishing Systems 

Section Subject 

1008.5.2.3 Smoke-protected seating 

1208.2 Dry cleaning plants 

1208.3 Dry cleaning machines 

1504.1 Spray finishing in Group A, E, I, or R 

1504.6 Spray booths and rooms 

1505.1 Dip-tank rooms 

1505.6.1 Dip tanks 

1505.8.4 Hardening and tempering tanks 

1803.10 HPM facilities 

1803.10.1.1 HPM work station exhaust 

1803.10.2 HPM gas cabinets 

1803.10.3 HPM corridors 

1803.10.4 HPM exhaust 

1803.10.4.1 HPM noncombustible ducts 

1803.10.4.2 HPM combustible ducts 

1907.3 Lumber production conveyor rooms’ 



8 

 

1908.7 Recycling facility conveyor rooms 

2106.1 Class A and B ovens 

2106.2 Class C and D ovens 

Table 2306.2 Storage fire protection 

2306.4 Storage 

2703.8.3.1 Gas rooms 

2703.8.4.3 Exhausted enclosures 

2704.5 Indoor storage of hazardous materials 

2705.1.8 Indoor dispensing of hazardous materials 

2804.4.1 Aerosol warehouses 

2904.5 Storage of more than 1,000 cubic feet of loose combustible 
fibers 

3306.5.2.1 Storage of smokeless propellant 

3306.5.2.3 Storage of small arms primers 

3404.3.7.5.1 Flammable and combustible liquid storage rooms 

3404.3.8.4 Flammable and combustible liquid storage warehouses 

3405.3.7.3 Flammable and combustible liquid Group H-2 or H-3 areas 

3704.1.2 Gas cabinets for highly toxic and toxic gas 

3704.1.3 Exhausted enclosures for highly toxic and toxic gas 

3704.2.7 Gas rooms for highly toxic and toxic gas 

3704.3.9 Outdoor storage for highly toxic and toxic gas 

4106.2.2 Exhausted enclosures or gas cabinets for silane gas 

4204.1.1 Pyroxylin plastic storage cabinets 

4204.1.3 Pyroxylin plastic storage vaults 

4204.2 Pyroxylin plastic storage and manufacturing 

International Building Code Sprinkler requirements as set forth in Section 903.2.16 of the 
International Building Code 

903.3 Installation requirements. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be designed and installed 
in accordance with Section 903.3.1 through 903.3.7. 
903.3.1 Standards. Sprinkler systems shall be designed and installed in accordance with 
Section 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3. 
903.3.1.1 NFPA 13 sprinkler systems. Where the provisions of this code require that a 
building or portion thereof be equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system, 



9 

 

sprinklers shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13 except as provided in 
Sections 903.3.1.1.1, 903.1.2 and 903.3.1.3, 
903.3.1.1.1 Exempt locations. Automatic sprinklers shall not be required in the following rooms 
or areas where such rooms or areas are protected with an approved automatic fire detection 
system in accordance with Section 907.2 that will respond to visible or invisible particles of 
combustion. Sprinklers shall not be omitted from any room merely because it is damp, of fire-
resistance-rated construction, or contains electrical equipment. 
1.    Any room where the application of water, or flame and water, constitutes a serious life or 
fire hazard. 
2.    Any room or space where sprinklers are considered undesirable because of the nature of 
the contents, when approved by the code official. 
3.    Generator and transformer rooms separated from the remainder of the building by walls 
and floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies having a fire-resistance rating of not less than two (2) 
hours. 
4.    In rooms or areas that are of noncombustible construction with wholly noncombustible 
contents. 
903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. Where allowed in buildings of Group R, up to and 
including four stories in height, automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed throughout in 
accordance with NFPA 13R. 
903.3.1.2.1 Balconies. Sprinkler protection shall be provided for exterior balconies and ground 
floor patios of dwelling units where the building is of Type V construction. Sidewall sprinklers 
that are used to protect such areas shall be permitted to be located such that their deflectors are 
within 1 inch (25 mm) to 6 inches (152 mm) below the structural members, and a maximum 
distance of 14 inches (356 mm) below the deck of the exterior balconies that are constructed of 
open wood joist construction. 
903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems. Where automatic sprinkler systems installed in one-
and two-family dwellings shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D. 
903.3.2 Quick-response and residential sprinklers. Where automatic sprinkler systems are 
required by this code, quick response or residential automatic sprinklers shall be installed in the 
following areas in accordance with Section 903.3.1 and their listings: 
1.    Throughout all spaces within a smoke compartment containing patient sleeping rooms in 
Group 1-2 in accordance with the International Building Code. 
2.    Dwelling units, guest rooms and sleeping rooms in Group R and I-1 occupancies. 
3.    Light-hazard occupancies are defined in NFPA 13. 
903.3.3 Obstructed locations. Automatic sprinklers shall be installed with due regard to 
obstructions that will delay activation or obstruct the water distribution pattern. Automatic 
sprinklers shall be installed in or under covered kiosks, displays, booths, concession stands, or 
equipment that exceeds four (4) feet (1219 mm) in width. Not less than a three (3) foot (914 
mm) clearance shall be maintained between automatic sprinklers and the top of piles of 
combustible fibers. 
Exception: Kitchen equipment under exhaust hoods protected with a fire extinguishing system in 
accordance with Section 904. 
903.3.4 Actuation. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be automatically actuated unless 
specifically provided for in this code. 
903.3.5 Water supplies. Water supplies for automatic sprinkler systems shall comply with this 
section and the standards referenced in Section 903.3.1. The potable water supply shall be 
protected against backflow in accordance with the requirements of this section and the 
International Plumbing Code. 
903.3.5.1 Domestic services. Where the domestic service provides the water supply for the 
automatic sprinkler system, the supply shall be in accordance with this section. 
903.3.5.1.1 Limited area sprinkler systems. Limited area sprinkler systems serving fewer than 
20 sprinklers on any single connection are permitted to be connected to the domestic service 
where a wet automatic standpipe is not available. Limited area sprinkler systems connected to 
domestic water supplies shall comply with each of the following requirements: 



10 

 

1.    Valves shall not be installed between the domestic water riser control valve and the 
sprinklers. Exception: An approved indicating control valve supervised in the open position in 
accordance with Section 903.4. 
2.    The domestic service shall be capable of supplying the simultaneous domestic demand and 
sprinkler demand required to be hydraulically calculated by NFPA 13, NFPA 13R, or NFPA 13D. 
903.3.5.1.2 Residential combination services. A single combination water supply shall be 
permitted provided that the domestic demand is added to the sprinkler demand as required by 
NFPA 13R. 
903.3.5.2 Secondary water supply. A secondary on-site water supply equal to the hydraulically 
calculated sprinkler demand, including the hose stream requirement, shall be provided for high-
rise buildings in Seismic Design Category C, D, E or F as determined by the International 
Building Code. The secondary water supply shall have a duration not less than 30 minutes as 
determined by the occupancy hazard classification in accordance with NFPA 13. 
Exception: Existing buildings. 
903.3.6 Hose threads. Fire hose threads used in connection with automatic sprinkler systems 
shall, be approved and shall be compatible with Fire Department hose threads. 
903.3.7 Fire Department connections. The location of fire department connections shall be 
approved by the code official. 
903.4 Sprinkler system monitoring and alarms. All valves controlling the water supply for 
automatic sprinkler systems, pumps, tanks, water levels and temperatures, critical air pressures, 
and water-flow switches on all sprinkler systems shall be electrically supervised. 
Exceptions: 
1.    Automatic sprinkler systems protecting one-and-two-family dwellings. 
2.    Limited area systems serving fewer than 20 sprinklers. 
3.    Automatic sprinkler systems installed in accordance with 13R where a common supply 
main is used to supply both domestic and automatic sprinkler systems and a separate shutoff 
valve for the automatic sprinkler system is not provided. 
4.    Jockey pump control valves that are sealed or locked in the open position. 
5.    Control valves to commercial kitchen hoods, paint spray booths or dip tanks that are sealed 
or locked in the open position. 
6.    Valves controlling the fuel supply to fire pump engines that are sealed or locked in the open 
position. 
7.    Trim valves to pressure switches in dry, preaction and deluge sprinkler systems that are 
sealed or locked in the open position. 
903.4.1 Signals. Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly different and shall be 
automatically transmitted to an approved central station, remote supervising station or 
proprietary supervising station as defined in NFPA 72 or, when approved by the code official, 
shall sound an audible signal at constantly attended location. 
Exceptions: 
1.    Underground key or hub valves in roadway boxes provided by the municipality or public 
utility are not required to be monitored. 
2.    Backflow prevention device test valves, located in limited area sprinkler system supply 
piping, shall be locked in the open position. In occupancies required to be equipped with a fire 
alarm system, the backflow preventer valves shall be electrically supervised by a tamper switch 
installed in accordance with NFPA 72 and separately annunciated. 
903.4.2 Alarms. Approved audible devices shall be connected to every automatic sprinkler 
system. Such sprinkler water-flow alarm devices shall be activated by water flow equivalent to 
the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system. Alarm devices 
shall be provided on the exterior of the building in an approved location. Where a fire alarm 
system is installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire 
alarm system. 
903.4.3 Floor control valves. Approved supervised indicating control valves shall be provided 
at the point of connection to the riser on each floor in high-rise buildings. 
903.5 Testing and maintenance. Sprinkler systems shall be tested and maintained in 
accordance with Section 901. 



11 

 

903.6 Existing buildings. The provisions of this section are intended to provide a reasonable 
degree of safety in existing structures not complying with the minimum requirements of the 
International Building Code by requiring installation of an automatic fire-extinguishing system. 
903.6.1 Pyroxylin plastics. All structures occupied for the manufacture or storage of articles of 
cellulose nitrate (pyroxylin) plastic shall be equipped with an approved automatic fire-
extinguishing system. Vaults located within buildings for the storage of raw pyroxylin shall be 
protected with an approved automatic sprinkler system capable of discharging 1.66 gallons per 
minute per square foot (68 L/min/m2) over the area of the vault. (Ord. 1259) 
eb. Definitions. Wherever the word "jurisdiction" is used in the International Fire Code it shall be 
held to mean the city of Tonganoxie. (Ord. 1259_______) 
f.c. Copies on file. Not less than three copies of the code hereinbefore incorporated by 
reference shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as adopted by ordinance No. 
1259_______" and filed with the city clerk to be open to inspection and available to the public at 
all reasonable hours. The police department, municipal judge and all administrative departments 
of the city charged with the enforcement of this chapter shall be supplied at the cost of the city 
such number of official copies of such code as may be deemed expedient. (Ord. 
1259_________) 
 

SECTION 2.     That this ordinance shall take effect and be enforced on January 1, 2019, after its 

passage, approval, and publication in the Tonganoxie Mirror, the official newspaper of the City 

of Tonganoxie. 

 

SECTION 3.         That all ordinances that conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are 

hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict.   

 

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL THIS 5
th

 DAY OF NOVEMBER, 2018.  

 

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR THIS 5
TH

 DAY OF NOVEMBER, 2018. 

       

 

 

(Seal)             

       ___________________________________ 

Jason K. Ward, Mayor 

 

 

Attest: 

 

___________________________________                                

Patricia C. Hagg, City Clerk 

 

Approved as to form: 

 

_________________________________ 

Shannon M. Marcano, City Attorney 


	2017 Draft Audit Report
	2017 Draft Audit Report
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 2
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 3
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 4
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 5
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 6
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 7
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 8
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 9
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 10
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 11
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 12
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 13
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 14
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 15
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 16
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 17
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 18
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 19
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 20
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 21
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 22
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 23
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 24
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 25
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 26
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 27
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 28
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 29
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 30
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 31
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 32
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 33
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 34
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 35
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 36
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 37
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 38
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 39
	2017 Draft Audit Report: Page 40


